OHLONE COMMUNITY COLLEGE DISTRICT

MEMORANDUM
TO: Board of Trustees
FROM: Douglas Treadway
DATE: March 29, 2006

SUBIJECT: Award of Bids for the Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology

Increment 2, Phase 2 Building Package

The following bids were opened at 2:00pm, March 9, 2006 for the Ohlone College Newark Center for Health
Sciences and Technology Increment 2, Phase 2 Building Package.

224-0206-Parking Lot Striping & Signage: The District received 1 bid from Weatherly Striping
located in San Carlos. The amount of the base bid is $34,958.00. This bid was reviewed and
Staff/Turner Construction determined that it was a reasonable bid.

225-0206-Off-Site Improvements: The District received 2 bids. The lowest responsive bidder is Top
Grade Construction, Inc. located in Livermore. The amount of the base bid is $144,000.00.
226-0206-Site Concrete & Reinforcement: The District received 1 bid which was incomplete and
considered Non-Responsive and over budget. Architects will conduct a value engineering analysis prior
to issuing a re-bid.

227-0206-Landscaping and Irrigation/Site Furnishings: The District received 2 bids, which were over
budget. Staff is recommending a rejection of all bids. Architects will conduct a value engineering
analysis prior to issuing a re-bid.

228-0206-Finish Carpentry/Millwork: The District received 1 bid that was over budget. Staff
recommends a rejection of bids and will be issuing a re-bid.

229-0206-Insulation/Fire Safing: The District received 2 bids. The lowest responsive bidder is Coast
Building Products located in Concord. The amount of the base bid is $352,674.00.
230-0206-Doors/Frames/Finish Hardware: The District received 2 bids. The lowest responsive bidder
is Walters & Wolf Interiors located in Fremont. The amount of the base bid is $513,319.00.
233-0206-Ceramic Tile: The District received 4 bids, which were over budget. Staff is recommending a
rejection of all bids. Architects will re-write specifications to include a more economical product prior to
issuing a re-bid.

234-0206-Terrazzo: The District received 1 bid from Associated Terrazzo Co. Inc. located in San

Francisco. The amount of the base bid is $248,480.00. This bid was reviewed and Staff/Turner
Construction determined that it was a reasonable bid.

235-0206-Acoustic Ceilings and Wall Treatments: The District received 4 bids. The lowest
responsive bidder is T3, Inc. located in Fremont. The amount of the base bid is $709,625.00.
236-0206-Carpeting/Resilient & Wood Flooring: The District received 2 bids however, after the bids
were opened, it was determined that the bidding documents needed clarification. Staff recommends a
rejection of all bids. Bidding documents will be corrected and re-issued.

237-0206-Painting & Wallcovering: The District received 4 bids. The lowest responsive bidder is C &
C Painting and Decorating located in San Jose. The amount of the base bid is $290,275.00.

238-0206-Toilet Partitions & Accessories: The District received 2 bids. The lowest responsive bidder
is Service Metal Products, Inc. located in Oakland. The amount of the base bid is $123,000.00.



239-0206-Misc. Specialties/Signage: The District received 2 bids. The lowest responsive bidder is
ISEC, Inc. located in Fremont. The amount of the base bid is $349,048.00 plus Add alternate numbers
AP1 (lockers), AP7 (digital whiteboards/mounting tracks) and AP8 (projection screens) for a total award
of $556,871.00

240-0206-Kitchen Equipment: The District received 2 bids. The lowest responsive bidder is Duray J.F.
Duncan Ind., Inc. located in Rancho Cordova The amount of the base bid is $74,785.00.

241-0206-Laboratory Casework: The District received 3 bids. The lowest responsive bidder is Dow
Diversified, Inc. located in Livermore. The amount of the base bid is $342,655.00.

242-0206-Window Treatments: The District received 1 bid from Peninsulators, Inc. located in San

Jose. The amount of the base bid is $124,175.00. This bid was reviewed and Staff/Turner Construction
determined that it was a reasonable bid.

243-0206-Geo-Thermal Coils: The District received 0 bids and will be issuing a re-bid.

Combined Bid#1-includes 228-0206-Finish Carpentry/Millwork and 241-0206-Laboratory
Casework: The District received 1 bid from ISEC, Inc. located in Fremont. The amount of the base bid
is $794,465.00. The lowest responsive individual bids were lower than this combined bid.

Combined Bid#2-includes 228-0206-Finish Carpentry/Millwork, 239-0206-Misc.
Specialties/Signage, 240-0206-Kitchen Equipment, 241-0206-Laboratory Casework and 242-0206-
Window Treatments: The District received 1 bid from ISEC, Inc. located in Fremont. The amount of
the base bid is $1,527,056.00. The lowest responsive individual bids were lower than this combined bid.

The following bids were opened at 2:00pm, March 16, 2006 for the Ohlone College Newark Center for
Health Sciences and Technology Increment 2, Phase 2 Building Package.

1.

232-0206 Drywall/Metal Framing/Spray-on Fireproofing: The District received 3 bids. The lowest
responsive bidder is J & J Acoustics located in San Jose. The amount of the base bid is $4,752,411.00.

The total amount for all bids is $8,267,228.00. There are sufficient funds to cover these bid awards in the
Bond funds.

RECOMMENDATION:

The President/Superintendent recommends that the Board of Trustees approve the award of bids for the
Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology Increment 2, Phase 2 Building Package
for bid numbers:

224-0206-Parking Lot Striping & Signage to Weatherly Striping for $34,958.00.
225-0206-Off-Site Improvements to Top Grade Construction, Inc. for $144,000.00.
229-0206-Insulation/Fire Safing to Coast Building Products for $352,674.00.
230-0206-Doors/Frames/Finish Hardware to Walters & Wolf Interiors for $513,319.00.
234-0206-Terrazzo to Associated Terrazzo Co. Inc. for $248,480.00.

235-0206-Acoustic Ceilings and Wall Treatments to T3, Inc. for $709,625.00.
237-0206-Painting & Wallcovering to C & C Painting and Decorating for $290,275.00.
238-0206-Toilet Partitions & Accessories to Service Metal Products, Inc. for $123,000.00.
239-0206-Misc. Specialties/Signage to ISEC, Inc. for $556,871.00.

240-0206-Kitchen Equipment to Duray J.F. Duncan Ind., Inc. for $74,785.00.
241-0206-Laboratory Casework to Dow Diversified, Inc. for $342,655.00.
242-0206-Window Treatments to Peninsulators, Inc. for $124,175.00.
232-0206-Drywall/Metal Framing/Spray-on Fireproofing to J & J Acoustics, Inc. for $4,752,411.00.



The President/Superintendent also recommends that the Board of Trustees reject all bids received for bid
numbers:

226-0206-Site Concrete & Reinforcement

227-0206-Landscaping and Irrigation/Site Furnishings

228-0206-Finish Carpentry/Millwork

233-0206-Ceramic Tile

236-0206-Carpeting/Resilient & Wood Flooring

Combined bid #1-includes 228-0206 and 241-0206

Combined bid #2-includes 228-0206, 239-0206, 240-0206, 241-0206 and 242-0206

NoogkrwbdPE

Attachments: Bid Results Scoring Grids



Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06
Bid number 224-0206 Parking Lot Striping & Signage

1 2 3 4
Riley's Wea_th_erly
Firm Name Striping Striping
Proposal No Bid y
Certified Check
Bid Bond #1000391640
Non-collusion Affidavit y
Insurance Qualification Form y
Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification y
Addendums: 3 Acknowledged 2
EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable 0.95
Base Bid $34,958.00
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP1 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP2 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of
the Base bid plus all alternates.
$0.00 $34,958.00 $0.00 $0.00

Recommended Amount of

: . $34,958.00
Award includes Base Bid only
Comments Low bid

Verified By: Marian Castaneda




Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06
Bid number 225-0206 Off-Site Improvements

1 2 3 4
McGuire &
Firm Name Hester Top Grade
Proposal y y
Bid Bond y y
Non-collusion Affidavit y y
Insurance Qualification Form y y
Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification y y
Addendums: 3 Acknowledged y y
EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable 0.66 0.56
Base Bid $247,525.00 $144,000.00
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP1 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP2 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of the
Base bid plus all alternates.
$247,525.00 $144,000.00 $0.00 $0.00
Recommended Amount of
Award includes Base Bid only $144,000.00
Comments Low bid

Verified By: Marian Castaneda




Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06
Bid number 226-0206 Site Concrete & Reinforcement

1 2 3 4
Bay Area Casey-Fogli
Firm Name Concrete Concrete
Proposal No bid y
Bid Bond n
Non-collusion Affidavit n
Insurance Qualification Form n
Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification n
Addendums: 3 Acknowledged y
EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable 0.86
Base Bid $3,507,000.00
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT ($67,000.00)
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP1 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP2 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of the
Base bid plus all alternates.
$0.00 $3,440,000.00 $0.00 $0.00
Recommended Amount of
Award (Base Bid + Alternates
# )
Comments Non-
Responsive

Verified By: Marian Castaneda




Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06

Bid number 227-0206 Landscaping & Irrigation/Site furnishings

1 2 3 4
Bothman, Jensen RMT
Robert A., | Landscaping | Landscaping
Firm Name Inc.
Proposal y y no bid
Bid Bond y y
Non-collusion Affidavit y y
Insurance Qualification Form y y
Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification y y
Addendums: 3 Acknowledged y y
EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable 0.85 0.82
Base Bid $3,977,341.00 | $3,638,555.00
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT ($27,299.00) ($2,170.00)
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT $0.00 $2,300.00
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT ($19,862.00) ($15,000.00)
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP1 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP2 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of the
Base bid plus all alternates.
$3,930,180.00 $3,623,685.00 $0.00 $0.00

Recommended Amount of
Award (Base Bid + Alternates
# )

Comments

Reject all bids

Verified By: Marian Castaneda




Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06

Bid number 228-0206 Finish Carpentry/Millwork

1 2 3 4
B-K Mill & Northwestern
Firm Name Fixture ISEC Design
Proposal no bid y no bid
Bid Bond y
Non-collusion Affidavit y
Insurance Qualification Form y
Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification y
Addendums: 3 Acknowledged y
EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable 0.69
Base Bid $397,107.00
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP1 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP2 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of the
Base bid plus all alternates.
$0.00 $397,107.00 $0.00 $0.00
Recommended Amount of
Award includes Base Bid only

Comments

Reject all Bids

Verified By: Marian Castaneda




Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06
Bid number 229-0206 Insulation/Fire Safing

1 2 3 4
Coast Building F. Rodgers
Firm Name Products Insulation
Proposal y y
Bid Bond y copy
Non-collusion Affidavit y y
Insurance Qualification Form y y
Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification y y
Addendums: 3 Acknowledged y y
EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable 0.88 0.74
Base Bid $352,674.00 $481,083.00
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP1 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP2 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of the
Base bid plus all alternates.
$352,674.00 $481,083.00 $0.00 $0.00
Recommended Amount of
Award includes Base Bid only $352,674.00
Comments Low Bid

Verified By: Marian Castaneda




Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06

Bid number 230-0206 Doors/Frames/Finish Hardware

1 2 3 4
B-K Mill & Walters &
Firm Name Fixture Trim Tech Wolf
Proposal no bid y y
Bid Bond y y
Non-collusion Affidavit y y
Insurance Qualification Form y y
Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification y y
Addendums: 3 Acknowledged y y
EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable 0.73 0.88
Base Bid $585,650.00 $513,319.00
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP1 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP2 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of the
Base bid plus all alternates.
$0.00 $585,650.00 $513,319.00 $0.00
Recommended Amount of
Award includes Base Bid only $513,319.00
Comments Low Bid

Verified By: Marian Castaneda




Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06

Bid number 233-0206 Ceramic Tile

1 2 3 4
California Reputable
Firm Name Tile Tile | Superior Tile Tile West
Proposal y y y y
Bid Bond y y y y
Non-collusion Affidavit y y y y
Insurance Qualification Form y y y y
Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification y y y y
Addendums: 3 Acknowledged y y y y
EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable 0.87 0.78 0.64 1.11
Base Bid $659,094.00 $601,794.00 $592,039.00 $571,877.00
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP1 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP2 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of the
Base bid plus all alternates.
$659,094.00 $601,794.00 $592,039.00 $571,877.00

Recommended Amount of
Award (Base Bid + Alternates
# )

Comments

Reject all bids

Verified By: Marian Castaneda




Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06
Bid number 234-0206 Terrazzo

1 2 3 4
Associated San
Francisco
Firm Name Terrazzo Terrazzo
Proposal y No Bid
Bid Bond y
Non-collusion Affidavit y
Insurance Qualification Form y
Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification y
Addendums: 3 Acknowledged y
EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable 0.93
Base Bid $248,480.00
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP1 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP2 ADD $148,000.00
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of the
Base bid plus all alternates. $396,480.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Recommended Amount of
Award includes Base Bid only $248,480.00
Comments Low Bid

Verified By: Marian Castaneda




Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06
Bid number 235-0206 Acoustic Ceilings & Wall Treatments

1 2 3 4

Ireland Performance | Spacetone T3. Inc
Firm Name Acoustics Contracting Acoustics : '
Proposal y y y y
Bid Bond n y y y

. . . N- recd 031006
Non-collusion Affidavit n y 9:03am y
Insurance Qualification Form n y y y
N- recd 031006

Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification n y 9:03am y
Addendums: 3 Acknowledged 2 y y y
EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable 0.77 0.53 1.03 0.86
Base Bid $580,776.00 $778,665.00 $696,440.00 $709,625.00
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT ADD $29,862.00 $0.00 $47,316.00 $42,697.00
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP1 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP2 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of the
Base bid plus all alternates.

$610,638.00 $778,665.00 $743,756.00 $752,322.00
Recommended Amount of
Award includes Base Bid only $709,925.00
Comments non-responsive non-responsive low bid

Verified By: Marian Castaneda




Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06
Bid number 236-0206 Carpeting/Resilient & Wood Flooring

1 2 3 4
BT CPC F!oor ComDrrTSrcial Hoem-Schurba &
_ L Covering Assoc.
Firm Name Mancini Inc.
Proposal no bid no bid y y
Bid Bond y y
Non-collusion Affidavit y y
Insurance Qualification Form y n
Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification y y
Addendums: 3 Acknowledged y y
EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable 0.65 0.94
Base Bid No Bid No Bid $601,994.00 507,145.34
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
($18,905.00) Not
Alternate Price AP1 ADD DEDUCT $0.00 alternate as specified
Alternate Price AP2 ADD DEDUCT ($35,900.00) ($24,390.00)
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $147,400.00 | #4172 541& 92825
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $174,922,00 | #4098 541 &$3.38
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $204,500.00 | 029 541 &$3.995
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $232,672.00 | 094 5aM&$4545
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of
the Base bid plus all alternates. $0.00 $0.00 $1,325,588.00 N/A

Recommended Amount of
Award (Base Bid + Alternates
#AP3 or AP4 or AP5 or AP6)

Reject all Bids

Comments

Non-Responsive-Unit
prices provided require
a calculation outside of

the bid form

Verified By: Marian Castaneda




Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06
Bid number 237-0206 Painting & Wallcovering

1 2 3 4
Blue Skies P Cf‘c & Fairway Jerry

Painting ainting Painting Thompson
Firm Name Dec.
Proposal y y y y

) Cashier Ck

Bid Bond y 413651098 y y
Non-collusion Affidavit y y y y
Insurance Qualification Form y y y y
Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification y y y y
Addendums: 3 Acknowledged y y y y
EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable 1.00 1.13 1.02 0.80
Base Bid $462,000.00 $290,275.00 $314,758.00 $553,286.00
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT $0.00 ($1,450.00) $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP1 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP2 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of
the Base bid plus all alternates.

$462,000.00 $288,825.00 $314,758.00 $553,286.00
Recommended Amount of
Award includes Base Bid only $290,275.00
Comments Low Bid

Verified By: Marian Castaneda




Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06

Bid number 238-0206 Toilet Partitions & Accessories

1 2 3 4

Service Metal Western
Firm Name Products Shower Door
Proposal y y
Bid Bond y y
Non-collusion Affidavit y y
Insurance Qualification Form y y
Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification y y
Addendums: 3 Acknowledged y y
EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable 0.81 0.9
Base Bid $123,000.00 $129,006.00
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP1 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP2 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of the
Base bid plus all aternates. $123,000.00 | $129,006.00 |  $0.00 $0.00
Recommended Amount of
Award includes Base Bid only $123,000.00
Comments Low Bid

Verified By: Marian Castaneda




Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06
Bid number 239-0206 Misc. Specialties/Sighage

1 2 3 4
Service
Metal
Firm Name ISEC Products
Proposal y y
Bid Bond y y
Non-collusion Affidavit y y
Insurance Qualification Form y y
Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification y y
Addendums: 3 Acknowledged y y
EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable 0.69 0.81
Base Bid $349,048.00 $358,500.00
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT ($20,390.00) ($35,100.00)
Alternate Price AP1 ADD $73,889.00 $76,300.00
Alternate Price AP2 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $57,371.00 $147,500.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $76,563.00 $81,300.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of the
Base bid plus all alternates.
$536,481.00 $628,500.00 $0.00 $0.00
Recommended Amount of
Award (Base Bid + ADD $556,871.00
Alternates # AP1, AP7 & AP8)
Comments Low Bid

Verified By: Marian Castaneda




Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06

Bid number 240-0206 Kitchen Equipment

1 2 3 4
Duray J.F. East Bay ISEC/BerI_in
Duncan Restaurant Food Equip
Firm Name Ind., Inc. co
Proposal y y No bid
Bid Bond y y
Non-collusion Affidavit y y
Insurance Qualification Form y y
Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification y y
Addendums: 3 Acknowledged y y
EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable 0.89 0.73
Base Bid $74,785.00 $106,298.46
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP1 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP2 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00 $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of
the Base bid plus all alternates.
$74,785.00 $106,298.46 $0.00 $0.00
Recommended Amount of
Award includes Base Bid $74,785.00
only
Comments Low Bid

Verified By: Marian Castaneda




Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06
Bid number 241-0206 Laboratory Casework

1 2 3 4
Advanced Dow
Lab Diversified
Firm Name Concepts ISEC
Proposal y y y
Bid Bond y y y
Non-collusion Affidavit y y y
Insurance Qualification Form n y y
Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification y y y
Addendums: 3 Acknowledged y y y
EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable 0.65 1.08 0.69
Base Bid $389,370.00 $342,655.00 $419,557.00
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP1 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP2 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of
the Base bid plus all alternates.
$389,370.00 $342,655.00 $419,557.00 $0.00
Recommended Amount of
Award includes Base Bid only $342,655.00
Comments Low Bid

Verified By: Marian Castaneda



Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06

Bid number 242-0206 Window Treatments

1 2 3 4

American

Blinds &
Firm Name Draperies, Inc. | Peninsulators
Proposal No Bid y
Bid Bond y
Non-collusion Affidavit y
Insurance Qualification Form y
Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification y
Addendums: 3 Acknowledged y
Echélg)trs;tligg: 1.19 or below is 0.85
Base Bid $124,175.00
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP1 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP2 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum
of the Base bid plus all alternates. $0.00 $124,175.00 $0.00 $0.00
Recommended Amount of
Award includes Base Bid $124,175.00
only
Comments Low Bid

Verified By: Marian Castaneda



Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06

Bid number 243-0206 Geo-Thermal Coils

Firm Name

Proposal No bids

Bid Bond

Non-collusion Affidavit

Insurance Qualification Form

Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification

Addendums: 3 Acknowledged

EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable

Base Bid

Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT

Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT

Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT

Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT

Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT

Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT

Alternate Price AP1 ADD

Alternate Price AP2 ADD

Alternate Price AP3 ADD

Alternate Price AP4 ADD

Alternate Price AP5 ADD

Alternate Price AP6 ADD

Alternate Price AP7 ADD

Alternate Price AP8 ADD

Alternate Price AP9 ADD

Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of the

Base bid plus all alternates.
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00

Recommended Amount of
Award (Base Bid + Alternates
# )

Comments

Verified By: Marian Castaneda



Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06

Combined Bid #1 includes bid numbers: 228-0206 & 241-0206

1
Calculation comparing individual Bids with
Firm Name ISEC combined bid
Proposal y Lowest Basis of
Award for each
Bid Bond y Bid Number bid number
Non-collusion Affidavit y 228-0206 $397,107.00
Insurance Qualification Form y 241-0206 $342,655.00
Total Individual
Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification y bid $739,762.00
Addendums: 3 Acknowledged y | Combination Bid $794,465.00
EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable 0.69
Base Bid $794,465.00
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP1 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP2 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of the
Base bid plus all alternates. $794.465.00
Total for
Comments individual bids
Lower than
combined bid.

Verified By: Marian Castaneda



Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/09/06

Combined Bid #2 includes bid numbers: 228-0206, 239-060

1
Calculation comparing individual Bids with
Firm Name ISEC combined bid
Proposal y Lowest Basis of
Award for each

Bid Bond y Bid Number bid number
Non-collusion Affidavit y 228-0206 $397,107.00
Insurance Qualification Form y 239-0206 $536,481.00
Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification y 240-0206 $74,785.00
Addendums: 3 Acknowledged y 241-0206 $342,655.00
EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable 0.69 242-0206 $124,175.00
Base Bid $1,339,623.00 | Total Individual bid | $1,475,203.00
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT $0.00 Combination Bid 1,527,056.00
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 DEDUCT ($20,390.00)
Alternate Price AP1 ADD $73,889.00
Alternate Price AP2 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $0.00
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $57,371.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $76,563.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of the
B bid pl Il alt tes.

ase Did plus all alternates $1,527,05600

Total for individual
Comments bids Lower than
combined bid.

Verified By: Marian Castaneda



Ohlone College Newark Center for Health Sciences and Technology: Increment 2 Phase 2 Bid Results 03/16/06

Bid number 232-0206 Drywall/Metal Framing/Spray-on Fireproofing

1 2 3 4
Aderholt J &‘]_ Performance
Firm Name Specialty Acoustics Contracting
Proposal y y y
Bid Bond y y y
Non-collusion Affidavit y y y
Insurance Qualification Form y y y
Drug-Free WorkPlace Certification y y y
Addendums: 4 Acknowledged 12,4 y y
EMR rating: 1.19 or below is acceptable n y y
Base Bid $5,033,218.00 $4,752,411.00] $5,894,259.00
Alternate Price AP7 DEDUCT ($26,352.00) ($26,245.00) ($23,000.00)
Alternate Price AP9 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP10 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP11 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP14 DEDUCT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP15 BEDUGCT ADD $20,315.00 $19,536.00 $22,000.00
Alternate Price AP1 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP2 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP3 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP4 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP5 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP6 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP7 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP8 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Alternate Price AP9 ADD $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Basis of Award: Aggregate sum of the
Base bid plus all alternates. $5,027,181.00 $4,745,702.00f $5,893,259.00 $0.00

Recommended Amount of Award
(Base Bid only)

$4,752,411.00

Comments

Low Bid

Verified By: Marian Castaneda
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